
FEBRUARY 25, 2019 - REGULAR MEETING - #8

VOLUME 22

MEETING

The Ross County Board of Commissioners met on this day, February 25, 2019, in regular session.

Mr. R. Douglas Corcoran, President, called the meeting to order at 9: 05 a.m., with Commissioners Stephen A. Neal and Dwight A.

Garrett also in attendance.

MINUTES APPROVED

Mr. Garrett moved, Mr. Neal seconded, that the minutes of the previous meeting of the Ross County Board of Commissioners, of
February 19, 2019, be approved as submitted.

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.

BILLS APPROVED FOR PAYMENT

Mr. Garrett moved, Mr. Neal seconded, that the following bills of the county be approved for payment:
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On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.



THEN & NOW CERTIFICATES APPROVED

Mr. Garrett moved, Mr. Neal seconded, that the Ross County Board of Commissioners approve " Then & Now" Certificates, dated

February 18, 2019 through February 22, 2019, in the amount of$ 16, 399.30 prepared by the Office of the Ross County Auditor and
certified by the auditor as to the appropriation of funds for the purpose of encumbering the sum of the contract( s) or order( s) outlined
therein, or the imminent collection of funds for credit to the appropriated fund( s) of the county, and as to the availability of funds for
transfer within the appropriate department( s).

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.

4TH ADDENDUM RECEIVED TO 2019 AMENDED OFFICIAL CERTIFICATE OF

ESTIMATED RESOURCES - VARIOUS FUNDS

The commissioners noted receipt of the following fourth addendum to the 2019 Amended Official Certificate of Estimated Resources,
from the Ross County Budget Commission, for Various Funds:
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APPROPRIATION OF FUNDS - TASK FORCE & JRIG GRANT

Mr. Neal moved, Mr. Garrett seconded, that $ 12, 000. 00 be appropriated in the Justice Reinvestment Incentive Grant Fund, from

unappropriated funds, to account code 4420- 20- 20- 7110, Electronic Monitoring, according to a request of February 15, 2019, from
common pleas court 41.

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.

Mr. Garrett moved, Mr. Neal seconded, that $ 100. 58 be appropriated in the Task Force Fund, from unappropriated funds, to account

code 4410-29- 02-7100, Travel, according to a request of February 20, 2019, from the sheriff

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.



APPROPRIATION APPLICTIONS APPROVED FOR MEETING ATTENDANCE    -

VETERANS

Mr. Garrett moved, Mr. Neal seconded, that the Ross County Board of Commissioners approve an application for an appropriation of
1, 500.00 ( approx.), submitted by Richard Shanks, Stacey Boroff, Nicholette Bolte, for their attendance upon the OSACVSO Spring

School 2019, to be held on April 24- 25, 2019, at Columbus, Ohio.

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.

ASSET DISPOSAL FORM APPROVED - JUVENILE COURT

Mr. Neal moved, Mr. Garrett seconded, that the Ross County Board of Commissioners approve an Asset Disposal Form submitted by
the Ross County Juvenile Court, for disposal of the following surplus personal property of the county as indicated:

QUANTITY DESCRIPTION METHOD OF DISPOSAL

One ( 1)    Chair, Tag 413241 Transfer to Surplus Property

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.

REQUEST FOR QUALIFICATIONS   (RFQ)' S OPEN  -  ROSS COUNTY-SHOEMAKER

AIRPORT

The commissioners opened Request for Qualifications (RFQ) Statements as advertised at 9: 30 a.m., for State of Qualifications and other
supporting information from qualified professional consulting firms, teams, or individuals to complete several projects during the next
five years for improvements to the Ross County- Shoemaker Airport, under the Federal Aviation Administration regulations.   The

following RFQ' s were received:

Stantec Consulting Richland Engineering Limited Brandstetter Carroll, Inc.

Columbus, Ohio Mansfield, Ohio Lexington, Kentucky

The RFQ' s were referred to Charlie Ortman, county engineer, Jim Park, Ross County-Shoemaker Airport operator and Commissioner
Neal, for review and recommendation for contract award.

ADVERTISING AUTHORIZED;     COMBINED PUBLIC HEARING SET     -     2019

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT   (CDBG)   ALLOCATION GRANT   &

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT IMPLEMENTATION STRATEGY (CDIS)

Mr. Neal moved, Mr. Garrett seconded, that publication be authorized in the Chillicothe Gazette, on February 28, 2019 & on the Ross

County Commissioner' s website ( RC 307. 87) at http://www.rosscountycommissioners.com., for the 2019 Community Development
Block Grant ( CDBG) Allocation Grant, and that said first of two public hearings be held on March 11, 2019, at 10: 00 a.m., and, the

Community Development Implementation Strategy ( CDIS)  to be held on March 13, 2019, at 10: 00 a.m., both in the Office of the Ross

County Board of Commissioners,  to provide citizens with pertinent information about the program requirements, including an
explanation of eligible activities.

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.

NATIONAL CHILD ABUSE PREVENTION MONTH - LIGHT COURTHOUSE BLUE

Mr. Neal moved, Mr. Garrett seconded, that National Child Abuse Prevention Month be observed by displaying blue lights on the tower
of the courthouse, for the month of April, 2019.

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.

VACATION LEAVE AUTHORIZED - CLERK

Mr. Garrett moved, Mr. Neal seconded, that Gail L. Stout, clerk to the Board, be authorized to take eight ( 8) hours vacation leave during
pay period ending March 2, 2019; and, sixteen ( 16) hours vacation leave during pay period ending March 16, 2019; and sixteen ( 16)
hours vacation leave during pay period ending March 30, 2019; and eight( 8) hours vacation leave during pay period ending July 6, 2019;
and eighty ( 80) hours vacation leave during pay period ending July 20, 2019.

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.

AUTHORIZE PAYMENT OF   $105.00 TO THE GREATER CHILLICOTHE ROSS

COUNTY DEVELOPMENT

Mr. Garrett moved, Mr. Neal seconded, that the Ross County Board of Commissioners hereby authorize a payment, in the amount of
1, 685. 00 to be paid from account code 4100- 01- 15- 7450, Grant Other, to the Greater Chillicothe Ross County Development, for purpose

of membership dues ($ 550.00) for Council of Development Finance Agencies ( CDFA) & one year membership ($ 1, 135. 00) to

GrantFinder.com.

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.



SEALED QUOTES OPENED - VARIOUS ROAD MATERIALS

The commissioners opened sealed quotes as advertised, at 11: 30 a.m., for the furnishing of various road materials.  Quotations were

submitted by the following vendors:

1.   Olen Corporation 4. The Shelly Company 7. The Wells Group, LLC
Columbus, OH Columbus, OH West Liberty, Kentucky

2.   Shelly and Sands, Inc. 5. Tow Path 8. Vailey Asphalt Corp.
Chillicothe, OH Beaver, OH Cincinnati, OH

3.   Melvin Stone Co., LLC 6. Hanson Excavating 9. Latham Limestone, LLC

Sabina, OH Chillicothe, OH Latham, Ohio

PRICES

Aa'; r,IctI       *Dump vilashed     _....     __...    ._.... ... .  

I& 2 Tam,.: .. 304 411   ...   11 9........   IRaclk     ' GlrBts Gravall ASPHALT COIN GRETE CONCRETE:   Add     Catcuwm,   Calcium Bag

Grits 441 448 TYPE 2 51P2 Bag 5 Bag  ,... 15 V2 Bag IHeatt........  Chi, 1%    Chi..2%     Grout

HANSON EXCAVATING INO BID NO BID NO B'ID NO BOD NO END INO RNID   $   1100

llemil 200,Tans Delivered NO BID NO BID NO 61D NO BVD NO BND NO EID S 5, 90 NO 1616]

LATHAM LIMESTONE S t0.60 S 99. 50 S 10."a9 S I1. 5Q $    9. 50 S 14, 40 S 950 NO BID

1, 4nimu^"Lr20070nsDeli, ered _$   17.:50 $   17.50 S 17. 5,D S 18, 50 5 1650 S 24. 40 $   16-60 INO1110

MELWINSTON . IPLANORD.  $  17. 0'J.....$   11. 0'p... 5 11. 0,47..$  13, 50..$    950..,  NO BID   $   9.50 NOIBID

N,N iinumv 200 TwX r lDeWiaeced   $  15. 00  $   16. 40 $  15. 00 $  17.5C  $   13 50 NO 61D   $  13. 60 NO' BID

MELWIN STONIE- HOPETOWN NO BID NO IB O IsC> BID NO IS ID S 610 NO B1D NO SID       $ 5.50

Miinimuirr 200 Tons Deliaeaod No 151D NO BID NO BID NO IBID'  $    940 NO BID NO IBID       $ 9. 00

MIEl STONE•WWfrMSPORT  $   11. 40  $   11. 0',7 $  11. 00  $  14 50 5 9.50 NO I  $   9150 VC7 89D

M2inira uan 200 Toros Cel   $....10. 090  $... 15 00 "   15. pQ.. '$ 1850....$   13. 50 NCY BNG  $   13. 50 ND BNO

OLEN CORP.( S. HIGH ST)   TYPE

l5P.100To,nsP'erD ay       .. S   " 11. 00 $...  1000.. 1,   11: 56..$  2400..,.,5 25,00 $... .. 1'll :S 9, 00.   $ 10.09

Over 1100 Tons Pv Day      $   1980..   $   1$.: 80 $  2.9. 30 $  32. 80:$   33.90 $   30;30 $   17; 80. ..:$ 18,8"       

TOW PAT" MATERIALS NO BID   '$   16,50...$  16. a0 S 16, 50 INO BND....  II BMD... S . .. 3.,50.    S'3, 50,  S... 1102. 0'0 S.... 105 00 : S 108..00 $    5..00 S 2. 5,0 $    5.D0 S  13 0. 00

Mink num 2D9 Tom Dr.4lvwe d   '$  18, 75  $   18"75: $  18, 75 S 18. 7'5 NO BUD    IBID   $   7, 00     $ 7, 00

SHELLY& SANDS INC 69-0 0 85,00

Sa 100 Tans Per Day NC I NO BND NO BND  $  10: 00 $    7,00 NO B! ID   $   8. 0J S 8: 00 5 6900 65, 00'

Over 100 Toros Per Day INC Go NO IBND NO BID NO BID NO We NO BID NO SID NO SID S 69 40 $   65.00

PACE A OF 2

PIRNCCS ItCg Ctt2-24. 19 TO 2. 11; 20

AGGREGATES       ' DiwmP__.   washed

1 R 2 Torn 304 411 8 9 Rack Grits Gravel ASPHAJ KBETE Add Calcium Calcium 9 Bag

Grits 4461 TYPE 1 4648 TYPE 2 5 V2 Bag 6 Bag 6 112 Bag Heat Ch1. 1%    Cl 2%     Grout

SHELLY MATERBALS 6'•3. 60..$   ' 57. 50

50. 000 Tens Per Lary 16350 $  .., 57. 60

Oreo 100 Turk IPer Day S 16350 $   57, 50

VALLEYASPHALTS   ;72.00 S 70,100

50-101D Tons Per Day 7200'.  ._5 70! 00

Over 100 Tons Per Day 16800 S 66 00.........

NON Ghioride)

WELLS CROUP 106.100 '$  179. 60 S 113. 00 $    7,:60 $    7. 00 $   14, 00 $  140 00

50 100 Twins Per D y

Over 100 Tons Per 02y

PAGE 2 of 2

The quotes were referred to Charlie Ortman, county engineer, for review.

END*****

ANNUAL COUNTY HIGHWAY SYSTEM MILEAGE CERTIFIED

Mr. Garrett moved, Mr. Neal seconded that the Ross County Board of Commissioners certifies and reports to the Ohio Department of
Transportation, in accordance with the provisions specified in Ohio Revised Code Section 4501. 04 ( Distribution of Revenue), that the

total mileage for Ross County for calendar year 2018 is 401. 630 miles.

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried



INVOICE APPROVED FOR PAYMENT - COMMISSIONERS PARKING LOTS

Mr. Neal moved, Mr. Garrett seconded, that the Ross County Board of Commissioners approve an invoice submitted by All Signs of
Chillicothe, Inc., for the purchase ofnew parking signs, to be placed on the LCBN Building and Clear Channel Buildings, in the amount
of$2, 500. 00, to paid from account code 4100- 01- 03- 7204, Capital Improvement Fund.

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Garrett yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.

SERVICE AGREEMENT EXTENDED APPROVED     -     ROSS COUNTY LAW

ENFORCEMENT CENTER

Mr. Neal moved, Mr. Garrett, seconded, that the Ross County Board of Commissioners, by its President, R. Douglas Corcoran, enter into
a Service Agreement with Johnson Controls, formerly SimplexGrinnell, for the fire sprinkler, alarm, extinguishers and backflow
preventers for annually/ quarterly tests and inspections; and, fire alarm system monitoring, in the amount of$ 5, 045. 00, effective March
1, 2019.

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes. Motion carried.

PROPOSALS APPROVED - RICK' S PARK N SAVE, INC.

Mr. Neal moved, Mr. Garrett seconded, that the Ross County Board of Commissioners approve a quote, from Rick' s Park N Save, Inc.,
for new carpeting, vinyl flooring, and supplies, for the law enforcement complex, located at 28 N. Paint Street, Chillicothe, Ohio, in the
amount of$4, 832.05, to be paid from account code 4100- 01- 03- 7204, Capital Improvement Fund.

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried.

ADVERTISING AUTHORIZED; BID OPENING SET - RETROREFLECTIVE PAVEMENT

MARKINGS (STRIPING) VARIOUS COUNTY & TOWNSHIP ROADS

Mr. Neal moved, Mr. Garrett seconded, that advertising be authorized for bids for the retroreflective pavement markings( striping) various
county and township roads in Ross County, and that bid opening for same be held in the Office of the Ross County Board of
Commissioners, on March 25, 2019, at 11: 30 a.m.

On call of the roll, the vote was:  Mr. Neal, yes; Mr. Garrett, yes; Mr. Corcoran, yes.  Motion carried

SUBJECTS BROUGHT BEFORE THE BOARD

Melody Young, Executive Director of the Ross- Chillicothe Convention & Visitors Bureau, met with the commissioners to present the

annual report for 2018.   Joe Letsche, director Ross County Park District was also in attendance.

Ms. Young reported that 2018 continues growth of many newer events and attractions.  The newest event captivated and immersed the

audience into the story of" Sleepy Hollow" and expanded the Scioto Society' s season on Sugarloaf Mountain. This production saw many
sold- out nights and added to festivities of fall tourism. Additionally, the annual Ohio Jeep Fest, the Buck Fifty relay-race, Southern Ohio
Forest Rally and the Chillicothe Halloween Festival continued to expand their attendance and experiences.

We are getting a new hotel behind Golden Corral.  The Hilton. Ross County' s lodging facilities continue to expand. We have a new bed
and breakfast named the Bird' s Nest B & B near Kingston.  Adena Mansion & Gardens reported the highest increase in attendance with

a 7% year- over-year increase.  The Majestic received $750, 000 to complete a new addition on the west side of the building increasing
access of the entry and restrooms that are ADA compliant.  And of course our World Heritage Ohio continues.  In May of 2018 the
Federal Register officially asked for the nomination of the Hopewell Ceremonial Earthworks.  This step in the process was long awaited
and a joyous occasion by the Ohio History Connection, National Park Services, and the many organizations and individuals who have
been working towards the achievement.

This will be our sixth annual tourism banquet.  Wow does time fly by.  The Sunflower Festival with see its 20th year and our brand new
two-week production of Mamma Mia at Sugarloaf Mountain Amphitheatre.  Due to increase requests the Bureau has received over the

past several years, the Board of Directors reviewed the annual promotional assistance program and increased its budget to $ 8, 000 for

2019.  This will allow the Bureau to participate locally with organizers and to assist financially with the promotion of their events to
generate additional visitors to Ross County.  We feel this is a plus for all.

Mr. Letsche said that our trails are very important and they are being destroyed by erosion problems.  We are seeking funding to save
out trails.  We would welcome any suggestions the Board has.

ADJOURNMENT

Mr. R. Douglas Corcoran, President, adjourned the regular meeting of, February 25, 2019, at 4: 10 p.m.

Board of Commissioners of Ross County, Ohio

R. Douglas Corcoran, President Stephen A. Neal, Vice President Dwight A. Garrett

Clerk










